

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL FOR: One Time Purchase of Security Cameras and Accessories for Maintenance, Repair, Replacement and Improvement of Existing Equipment
 TIME & DATE: 3:00 p.m., June 9, 2015

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY	UNIT PRICE	31.400.00	33.263.00	36.000.00	35.796.50	36.481.00	36.919.50	37.645.00	40.895.00	48.545.40	BID NOT TABULATED INCOMPLETE BID	NO BID	NO BID								
1.	50 ea. Axis P3364-VE Exterior Vandal Resistant Fixed Dome IP Camera Manufacturer: <u>AXIS</u> Description: <u>Exterior Vandal Resistant Fixed Dome IP Camera 6MM</u> Part No.: <u>0482-001</u>	628.00 TOTAL	31,400.00	665.26 TOTAL	33,263.00	720.00 TOTAL	36,000.00	715.93 TOTAL	35,796.50	729.62 TOTAL	36,481.00				738.39 TOTAL	36,919.50	752.90 TOTAL	37,645.00	817.90 TOTAL	40,895.00	970.908 TOTAL	48,545.40
2.	30 ea. Axis P3364-VE Exterior Vandal Resistant Fixed Dome IP Camera Manufacturer: <u>AXIS</u> Description: <u>Exterior Vandal Resistant Fixed Dome IP Camera 12MM</u> Part No.: <u>0484-001</u>	628.00 TOTAL	18,840.00	645.87 TOTAL	19,376.10	720.00 TOTAL	21,600.00	715.93 TOTAL	21,477.90	729.62 TOTAL	21,888.60				738.39 TOTAL	22,151.70	752.90 TOTAL	22,587.00	817.90 TOTAL	24,537.00	970.908 TOTAL	29,127.24
3.	20 ea. Axis P3364-LVE Exterior Vandal Resistant Fixed Dome IP Camera with IR Illumination Manufacturer: <u>AXIS</u> Description: <u>Exterior Vandal Resistant Fixed Dome IP Camera with IR Illumination 6MM</u> Part No.: <u>0476-001</u>	388.00 TOTAL	7,760.00	717.70 TOTAL	14,354.00	800.00 TOTAL	16,000.00	795.96 TOTAL	15,919.20	816.36 TOTAL	16,327.20				819.36 TOTAL	16,387.20	836.65 TOTAL	16,733.00	908.88 TOTAL	18,177.60	970.908 TOTAL	19,418.16
4.	20 ea. Axis P3364-LVE Exterior Vandal Resistant Fixed Dome IP Camera with IR Illumination Manufacturer: <u>AXIS</u> Description: <u>Exterior Vandal Resistant Fixed Dome IP Camera with IR Illumination 12MM</u> Part No.: <u>0473-001</u>	698.00 TOTAL	13,960.00	717.70 TOTAL	14,354.00	800.00 TOTAL	16,000.00	795.56 TOTAL	15,911.20	816.36 TOTAL	16,327.20				819.36 TOTAL	16,387.20	836.65 TOTAL	16,733.00	908.88 TOTAL	18,177.60	970.908 TOTAL	19,418.16
5.	15 ea. Axis Q6045-E Mk II Exterior Vandal Resistant PTZ Dome IP Camera Manufacturer: <u>AXIS</u> Description: <u>Exterior Pan-Tilt-Zoom Camera</u> Part No.: <u>0694-004</u>	2,504.00 TOTAL	37,560.00	2,585.67 TOTAL	38,785.05	2,900.00 TOTAL	43,500.00	2,866.11 TOTAL	42,991.65	3,035.82 TOTAL	45,537.30				2,924.47 TOTAL	43,867.05	3,014.14 TOTAL	45,212.10	3,274.33 TOTAL	49,114.95	3,886.72 TOTAL	58,300.80
6.	20 ea. Axis Q3505- VE Exterior Vandal Resistant Dome IP Camera Manufacturer: <u>AXIS</u> Description: <u>Exterior IP Camera 22MM</u> Part No.: <u>0619-001</u>	873.00 TOTAL	17,460.00	897.35 TOTAL	17,947.00	1,000.00 TOTAL	20,000.00	994.65 TOTAL	19,893.00	1,015.34 TOTAL	20,306.80				1,021.78 TOTAL	20,435.60	1,046.03 TOTAL	20,920.60	1,136.32 TOTAL	22,726.40	1,348.908 TOTAL	26,978.16
7.	10 ea. Axis Q1765-LE Exterior IP Camera with Built in IR Illumination Manufacturer: <u>AXIS</u> Description: <u>Outdoor Network Camera</u> Part No.: <u>0509-001</u>	977.00 TOTAL	9,770.00	1,005.10 TOTAL	10,051.00	1,200.00 TOTAL	12,000.00	1,114.10 TOTAL	11,141.00	1,173.51 TOTAL	11,735.10				1,143.22 TOTAL	11,432.20	1,171.65 TOTAL	11,716.50	1,272.79 TOTAL	12,727.90	1,510.896 TOTAL	15,108.96
8.	20 ea. Axis Pendant Kit for P33 -VE compatible with Axis P33 series, model 5502-321 Manufacturer: <u>AXIS</u> Description: <u>Pendant Kit</u> Part No.: <u>5502-321</u>	34.00 TOTAL	680.00	36.40 TOTAL	728.00	40.00 TOTAL	800.00	39.02 TOTAL	780.40	42.50 TOTAL	850.00				43.59 TOTAL	871.80	41.04 TOTAL	820.80	44.58 TOTAL	891.60	42.12 TOTAL	842.40
9.	30 ea. Axis T91D61 Wall Bracket for P33 -VE compatible with Axis P33 series, model 5504-821 Manufacturer: <u>AXIS</u> Description: <u>Wall Bracket</u> Part No.: <u>5504-821</u>	59.00 TOTAL	1,770.00	60.34 TOTAL	1,810.20	70.00 TOTAL	2,100.00	66.90 TOTAL	2,007.00	72.86 TOTAL	2,185.80				71.11 TOTAL	2,133.30	70.35 TOTAL	2,110.50	76.42 TOTAL	2,292.60	90.72 TOTAL	2,721.60
10.	30 ea. Axis T91A47 Pole Mount for P33 series cameras compatible with Axis P33 Series cameras, model 5504-701 Manufacturer: <u>AXIS</u> Description: <u>Pole Mount</u> Part No.: <u>5504-701</u>	48.00 TOTAL	1,440.00	50.30 TOTAL	1,509.00	55.00 TOTAL	1,650.00	54.94 TOTAL	1,648.20	59.85 TOTAL	1,795.50				59.52 TOTAL	1,785.60	86.25 TOTAL	2,587.50	71.87 TOTAL	2,156.10	85.32 TOTAL	2,559.60
11.	10 ea. Axis T91B61 Wall Mount Kit for Q60-E PTZ Series cameras Manufacturer: <u>AXIS</u> Description: <u>Wall Mount Kit</u> Part No.: <u>5504-621</u>	69.00 TOTAL	690.00	72.80 TOTAL	728.00	80.00 TOTAL	800.00	78.84 TOTAL	788.40	85.87 TOTAL	858.70				82.70 TOTAL	827.00	82.91 TOTAL	829.10	90.07 TOTAL	900.70	106.92 TOTAL	1,069.20
12.	5 ea. Axis Pole Mount Kit for Q6045-E cameras compatible with Axis Q60-E Series cameras Manufacturer: <u>AXIS</u> Description: <u>Pole Mount Kit</u> Part No.: <u>5017-671</u>	69.00 TOTAL	345.00	73.60 TOTAL	368.00	80.00 TOTAL	400.00	78.84 TOTAL	394.20	85.87 TOTAL	429.35				81.90 TOTAL	409.50	82.91 TOTAL	414.55	96.14 TOTAL	480.70	106.92 TOTAL	534.60

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL FOR: One Time Purchase of Security Cameras and Accessories for Maintenance, Repair, Replacement and Improvement of Existing Equipment
 TIME & DATE: 3:00 p.m., June 9, 2015

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY		Halfraix Security Inc. dba North American Video 301 Drum Point Rd. Brick, NJ 08723	Alterman Technologies 1403 Jones Maltsberger San Antonio, TX 78247	Via Technology 711 Navarro Street, Suite 215 San Antonio, TX 78205	Netronix Integration 800 Paloma Dr., Suite 110 Round Rock, TX 78665	Sology Solutions 1701 Analog Drive Richardson, TX 75081	Simplexgrinnell 1070 Aron Circle, Suite 102 San Antonio, TX 78216	Kratos Public Safety & Security 211 North Loop 1604 East San Antonio, TX 78232	Metroplex Control Systems dba Argyle Security Group 12903 Delivery Drive San Antonio, TX 78201	Chris Wolf, Inc. 8563 N Hwy 181 Floresville, TX 78114	Progressive Systems, LLC dba Lensec, LLC 1800 Bering Drive, Suite 751 Houston, TX 77057	Johnson Controls	Safety Vision
13.	10 ea. Axis T94M01D Pendant Kit for Q3505-VE cameras compatible with Axis ceiling, wall and pole mounts Manufacturer: <u>AXIS</u> Description: <u>Pendant Kit</u> Part No.: <u>5505-091</u>	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	41.00 410.00	43.80 438.00	50.00 500.00	46.99 469.90	51.18 511.80	51.79 517.90	49.41 494.10	53.68 536.80	63.72 637.20	BID NOT TABULATED INCOMPLETE BID	NO BID	NO BID
14.	10 ea. APC Smart-UPS 1500VA SMT1500RM2U Manufacturer: <u>American Power Conversion</u> Description: <u>Rack Mount Uninterruptable Power Supply</u> Part No.: <u>SMT1500RM2U</u>	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	643.00 6,430.00	657.80 6,578.00	700.00 7,000.00	703.28 7,032.80	728.11 7,281.10	672.38 6,723.80	769.53 7,695.30	824.11 8,241.10	913.548 9,135.48			
15.	10 ea. APC Smart-UPS 750VA 120V US Manufacturer: <u>American Power Conversion</u> Description: <u>Uninterruptable Power Supply</u> Part No.: <u>SMT750</u>	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	283.00 2,830.00	288.90 2,889.00	320.00 3,200.00	308.91 3,089.10	319.81 3,198.10	300.28 3,002.80	338.00 3,380.00	361.87 3,618.70	380.76 3,807.60			
16.	4 ea. 24 inch Hoffman Protek Double-Hinged Cabinet with AC Manufacturer: <u>Hoffman</u> Description: <u>Outdoor Security Enclosure</u> Part No.: <u>PTHS242428G4A</u>	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	2,823.00 11,292.00	2,891.00 11,564.00	2,600.00 10,400.00	2,911.70 11,646.80	3,427.06 13,708.24	3,431.61 13,726.44	3,118.75 12,475.00	3,542.76 14,171.04	3,482.0275 13,928.11			
17.	4 ea. Steel back panel for Protek Double-Hinged Cabinet Manufacturer: <u>Hoffman</u> Description: <u>Outdoor Security Enclosure Back Panel</u> Part No.: <u>CP2020</u>	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	41.00 164.00	42.75 171.00	40.00 160.00	42.74 170.96	53.53 214.12	49.54 198.16	47.50 190.00	51.99 207.96	51.1075 204.43			
18.	8 ea. Rack Angles for Protek Double-Hinged Cabinet Manufacturer: <u>Hoffman</u> Description: <u>Outdoor Security Enclosure Rack Angles</u> Part No.: <u>PTRA24T</u>	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	120.00 960.00	123.13 985.04	115.00 920.00	123.34 986.72	147.06 1,176.48	152.61 1,220.88	137.50 1,100.00	150.07 1,200.56	166.40375 1,331.23			
19.	4 ea. Hoffman Accessplus II Double-Hinged Cabinet Manufacturer: <u>Hoffman</u> Description: <u>Indoor Security Enclosure</u> Part No.: <u>EWMS242425</u>	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	420.00 1,680.00	431.75 1,727.00	440.00 1,760.00	485.23 1,940.92	597.65 2,390.60	592.10 2,368.40	526.25 2,105.00	590.52 2,362.08	580.405 2,321.62			
20.	4 ea. Hoffman Rack Angles for Accessplus II Double-Hinged Cabinet Manufacturer: <u>Hoffman</u> Description: <u>Additional Rack Angles for Security Enclosure</u> Part No.: <u>EWMR24T</u>	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	90.00 360.00	92.00 368.00	90.00 360.00	92.05 368.20	95.29 381.16	115.30 461.20	106.25 425.00	112.12 448.48	121.32 485.28			
21.	4 ea. Hoffman Fan Kit for Accessplus II Double-Hinged Cabinet Manufacturer: <u>Hoffman</u> Description: <u>Fan Kit for Security Enclosure</u> Part No.: <u>EWMF2</u>	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	99.00 396.00	101.75 407.00	100.00 400.00	101.45 405.80	123.53 494.12	128.48 513.92	116.25 465.00	123.44 493.76	1,567.9675 6,271.87			
22.	4 ea. Hoffman Protek Double-Hinged Solid Door Type 3R Enclosure Manufacturer: <u>Hoffman</u> Description: <u>Indoor/Outdoor Enclosure</u> Part No.: <u>PTHS242424G3</u>	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	1,257.00 5,028.00	1,308.75 5,235.00	1,200.00 4,800.00	1,311.14 5,244.56	1,588.24 6,352.96	1,218.98 4,875.92	1,437.50 5,750.00	1,595.31 6,381.24	1,567.85 6,271.40			
23.	10 ea. 2N Helios IP Force Intercom 1Bottom + 10W Speaker + Camera Manufacturer: <u>2N Telecommunications</u> Description: <u>Voice and Video IP Intercom</u> Part No.: <u>9151101CW</u>	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	807.00 8,070.00	845.34 8,453.40	800.00 8,000.00	855.68 8,556.80	882.35 8,823.50	904.95 9,049.50	936.25 9,362.50	894.70 8,947.00	951.156 9,511.56			

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL FOR: One Time Purchase of Security Cameras and Accessories for Maintenance, Repair, Replacement and Improvement of Existing Equipment
TIME & DATE: 3:00 p.m., June 9, 2015

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY	UNIT	Halifax Security Inc. dba North American Video 301 Drum Point Rd. Brick, NJ 08723	Alterman Technologies 1403 Jones Maltsberger San Antonio, TX 78247	Via Technology 711 Navarro Street, Suite 215 San Antonio, TX 78205	Netronix Integration 800 Paloma Dr., Suite 110 Round Rock, TX 78665	Sology Solutions 1701 Analog Drive Richardson, TX 75081	Simplexgrinnell 1070 Arion Circle, Suite 102 San Antonio, TX 78216	Kratos Public Safety & Security 211 North Loop 1604 East San Antonio, TX 78232	Metroplex Control Systems dba Argyle Security Group 12903 Delivery Drive San Antonio, TX 78201	Chris Wolf, Inc. 8563 N Hwy 181 Floresville, TX 78114	Progressive Systems, LLC dba Lensec, LLC 1800 Bering Drive, Suite 751 Houston, TX 77057	Johnson Controls	Safety Vision
24.	30 ea. MP Interior Fixed Dome IP Camera Axis P3354, 6MM Manufacturer: <u>AXIS</u> Description: <u>MP IP Fixed Dome Camera with 6MM Lens</u> Part No.: <u>0465-001</u>	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	424.00 12,720.00	444.97 13,349.10	480.00 14,400.00	477.01 14,310.30	505.12 15,153.60	495.51 14,865.30	501.65 15,049.50	544.96 16,348.80	646.908 19,407.24	BID NOT TABULATED INCOMPLETE BID	NO BID	NO BID
25.	20 ea. MP Interior Fixed Dome IP Camera Axis P3354, 12MM Manufacturer: <u>AXIS</u> Description: <u>MP IP Fixed Dome Camera with 12MM Lens</u> Part No.: <u>0467-001</u>	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	424.00 8,480.00	444.95 8,899.00	480.00 9,600.00	477.01 9,540.20	505.12 10,102.40	495.51 9,910.20	501.65 10,033.00	544.96 10,899.20	646.908 12,938.16			
26.	10 ea. 2N Helios IP Vario 1 button Intercom Manufacturer: <u>2N Telecommunications</u> Description: <u>Voice Intercom</u> Part No.: <u>9137111CU</u>	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	577.00 5,770.00	547.30 5,473.00	545.00 5,450.00	630.68 6,306.80	667.88 6,678.80	669.07 6,690.70	648.75 6,487.50	645.58 6,455.80	655.668 6,556.68			
27.	5 ea. Axis T91A64 Corner Bracket Manufacturer: <u>AXIS</u> Description: <u>Corner Bracket</u> Part No.: <u>5017-621</u>	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	56.00 280.00	152.20 761.00	150.00 750.00	150.50 752.50	68.52 342.60	154.16 770.80	158.29 791.45	71.87 359.35	85.32 426.60			
28.	20 ea. Axis P33 Series Pendant Kit Manufacturer: <u>AXIS</u> Description: <u>Pendant Kit</u> Part No.: <u>5502-351</u>	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	29.00 580.00	28.45 569.00	40.00 800.00	31.05 621.00	33.83 676.60	36.34 726.80	32.66 653.20	35.49 709.80	42.12 842.40			
29.	3 ea. UTC Microcontroller M3000 PXNPlus for Picture Perfect, Secure Perfect and FCWnx Manufacturer: <u>UTC Fire & Security</u> Part: <u>M3PPMP, M3000 PXNPlus for Picture Perfect</u>	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	5,100.00 15,300.00	2,022.34 6,067.02	2,150.00 6,450.00	2,147.73 6,443.19	2,429.41 7,288.23	3,113.06 9,339.18	2,763.79 8,291.37	2,360.00 7,080.00	1,809.91 5,429.73			
30.	10 ea. UTC Direct Door Controller DD1FC, 2 reader IP controller, for FCWnx and SP systems Manufacturer: <u>UTC Fire & Security</u> Part: <u>DD1FC</u>	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	839.00 8,390.00	862.80 8,628.00	950.00 9,500.00	916.36 9,163.60	1,023.53 10,235.30	1,136.30 11,363.00	1,149.75 11,497.50	1,006.93 10,069.30	1,056.23 10,562.30			
	GRAND TOTAL	TOTAL	230,815.00	235,834.91	255,300.00	255,798.80	269,732.26	269,932.55	274,555.07	291,609.12	334,693.17			
	Terms		Net 30 days	Net 30 days	Net 30 days	Net 30 days	Net 30 days	Net 30 days	2% 10 days	Net 30 days	3% 15 days			
	Delivery Days					15 days	21 days		15 days	15 days	15 days			

***LOW BIDDER**

BID INVITATIONS WERE MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

Johnson Controls
3 Sixty Integrated
A&B Security Integration
Accutronics
Alarm Integrations
Alterman Technologies
American Surveillance
Americas Computer
Anixter
Aprisa Technology
ARC
Automatic Gates Cameras & More
Automation Data Technology

B&H Photo Foto & Electroncis
Blackbox Network
Blue Armore Security
Bob McIntosh Audio Visal
Chris Wolf, Inc.
Circle Surveillance
Convergint
DHS Security
En Pointe Technologies
Entech Sales & Service
Facekey
Firetrol Protection Systems
Halifax Security Inc.

IDN-ACME
Inet Security & Surveillance
ISI Automation
ISI Security
Kratos Public Safety & Security
Major Inc Rx Technology
MCS Fire & Security
Metroplex Control Systems
Multilink Security
Netronix Integration
North American Video
P3S Co.
Progressive Systems, LLC

Royall Systems
Safety Vision
Securadyne Systems
Sigma Solutions
Silmar Electronics
Simplexgrinnell
Sology
Structure Works
Via Technology

Demandstar
SAWS Website